-------- Original message --------

From: Tena Sunde <tena.sunde@estherville.lib.ia.us>

Date: 5/8/23 1:55 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: ejnims75@gmail.com, tena.sunde@estherville.lib.ia.us, dawnwebbod@hotmail.com,
christensendorothy5@gmail.com, kimanderson2000x@gmail.com, chouseman4@hotmail.com,
pspoo@bankplusiowa.com, d.spoo@mchsi.com, lilirjensen@gmail.com,
I.hevern@cityofestherville.org, becky domek@hotmail.com

Subject: Please vote on pay app #8

Friends Board Members,
Attached please find Pay App #8 from our general contractor, in the amount of $47,485.25.

Would someone make a motion, second it, and then would you all vote, please? Once we have
enough votes I'll forward it along to Cheryl for payment.

Thank you,
Tena

Tena Sunde, Director
Estherville Public Library

613 Central Ave.

Estherville, IA 51334
712-362-7731
tena.sunde@estherville.lib.ia.us

Replies:

e Cheryl: I'll make a motion to pay this bill. (message went only to TS)
e Dorothy: | move we approve payment of Pay App #8

e Becky: | will second the motion and vote yes

e Pam: |voteyes

e Lili: Ivote yes

e Joan: | vote yes

e Lyle: | vote yes

e Kim: | also vote yes



